Joliet Junior College
Bid for Culinary Arts Equipment & Supplies

5/24/2016
Styled Ice, Inc. Midwest Imports Douglas Equipment Trimark Boelter Companies Ice Crafters sam Tell & Son Edward Don
ITEM QTY__ DESCRIPTION UNIT COST_TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST |UNIT COST_TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST _TOTAL COST
NEW ARCOBALENO AEX30 “STELLA”
1 2 TABLETOP PASTA EXTRUDER OR
EQUIVALENT
no bid no bid $9,467.00| $18,934.00]no bid $8,270.00| $16,540.00]no bid $8,447.50| $16,895.00] $7,743.03| $15,486.06)
Model ARCOBALENO ARCOBALENO ARCOBALENO As Specified
er] AEX30 AEX30 STELLA AEX30
Warranty 12 MONTHS 1 YEAR PARTS/LABOR MANUFACTURERS
) ,  |SETOF ARCOBALENO AEX PASTA
EXTRUDER DIES OR EQUIVALENT
no bid no bid $4,705.00|  $9,410.00]no bid $4,950.00|  $9,900.00]no bid $4,697.90| $9,395.80]  $203.70|  $8,963.00)
3 2 ARCOBALENO PASTA CARTE MODEL
APC-7 (7 TRAYS) OR EQUIVALENT
no bid no bid $970.00|  $1,940.00fno bid $910.00|  $1,820.00fno bid $926.50| $1,853.00]  $865.73| $1,731.46|
BRAVO MAGIC CARPET EVO
4 1 |CHOCOLATE ENROBING ATTACHMENT
OR EQUIVALENT
no bid no bid $9,451.00|  $9,451.00]no bid $9,090.00|  $9,090.00]no bid no bid $9,146.25|  $9,146.25|
5 1 MINIPAC MVS45X VACUUM SEALING
MACHINE OR EQUIVALENT
no bid $2,983.00|  $2,983.00] $2,664.36| $2,664.36|no bid no bid no bid $3,685.41|  $3,685.41]
MAUVIEL 11.8” M'STEEL WOK WITH
6 10  |STEEL HANDLE, MAUVIEL PRODUCT
NUMBER: 3632.30 OR EQUIVALENT
no bid no bid $111.00| $1,110.00]  $49.95 $499.50 $59.50 $595.00no bid $56.25 $562.50]  $50.89 $508.90
7 14 DE BUYER-FORCE BLUE 8.8” FRY PAN,
MODEL 5300.22 OR EQUIVALENT
no bid $17.80 $249.20] $26.46 $370.44| $11.49 $160.86] $12.30 $172.20no bid $26.10 $365.40 $17.57 $245.98]
s 14 |DEBUYER-FORCE BLUE 9.6” FRY PAN,
MODEL 5300.24 OR EQUIVALENT
no bid $20.06 $280.84 $31.79 sass.06]  $1201 $180.74]  $13.90 $194.60|no bid $31.44 $440.16]  $18.93 $265.02)
DE BUYER-FORCE BLUE 9.6” PANCAKE
9 10 PAN, BLUE IRON, MODEL 5390.24 OR
EQUIVALENT
no bid $29.00 $290.00] $17.69 $176.90]  $10.63 $106.30]  $19.80 $198.00]no bid $17.19 $171.90)  $24.23 $242.30]
STEELITE PLATE SERVING 14-5/8"
10 42 |CHINA, CRAFT GREY, PRODUCT #
11540501
no bid no bid $6201| $2,604.42]  $2192 $92064]  $46.90|  $1,969.80|no bid $4182| $1,756.23|  $43.39| $1,822.38
CHURCHILL SPGSR121 no bid
STEELITE PLATTER SERVING 10-5/8X6-
1 54 1/2", CRAFT GREY, PRODUCT #
11540550
no bid no bid $43.64| $2,356.56]  $2155| $1,293.00]  $32.95| $1,779.30|no bid $29.37| $1,585.89] 33072 $1,658.88]
CHURCHILL SPGSOP111
Qry - 60
STEELITE PLATE COUPE 11-1/4" WABI
12 42 SABI, WABI SABI LICHEN, PRODUCT #
6415MY009
no bid no bid $7181| $3,016.02] 1462 $701.96 $54.45|  $2,286.90|no bid $48.56| $2,039.52] 35039 $2,116.38]
CHURCHILL SWHSEV111
Qry-48
SCHONWALD PLATTER OVAL 12-
13 204 [1/2X9", AVANTI GUSTO, PORCELAIN
WHITE, PRODUCT # 9192034
no bid no bid no bid $23.56| $4,806.24]  $21.25| $4,335.00]no bid $22.93| $4,677.02|  $20.49| $4,179.96
SCHONWALD PLATTER OVAL 10-1/2X5
14 54 |1/2" GRACE, PORCELAIN WHITE,
PRODUCT # 9392226
no bid no bid no bid $27.99|  $1,511.46 $25.26|  $1,364.04no bid $27.27| $1,472.31)  $24.26| $1,5310.04
SYRACUSE CHINA PLATE 13-3/4X7-
15 72 1/2" SLENDA, TRIFORM WHITE,
PRODUCT # 905356404
no bid no bid $27.22| $1,959.84 $8.70 $626.40]  $11.55 $831.60|no bid $12.45 $896.40| $7.64 $550.08)
SYRACUSE CHINA PLATE VALLA SQR
16 60  |10-3/4" SLENDA, PRODUCT #
905356017
no bid no bid $15.33 $919.80]  $13.64 $818.40 $15.15 $909.00|no bid $16.34 $980.40]  $11.82 $709.20]
WORLD TABLEWARE BOWL BELMAR
17 204 |13 OZ CHEFS SELECTION WHITE,
BELMAR, PRODUCT # BW-7100
no bid no bid $14.77| $3,013.08]  $1127] $2,299.76 $12.31|  $2,511.24]no bid $12.90| $2,631.60]  $1124| $2,292.96]
WORLD TABLEWARE PLATTER ROUND
18 54 |PIZZA 13-1/2", FARMHOUSE,
PRODUCT #FH-527
no bid no bid $18.17 $981.18]  $13.29 $717.57 $14.50 $783.00no bid $15.22 $82161]  $11.80 $637.20]
|-SCULPT 3-D UPRIGHT CNC MODEL #
CNC 2105
INCLUDING:
19 1 [@2-DAY ON SITE SET-UP,
PROGRAMMING, OPERATION AND
MAINTENANCE TRAINING AT JOLIET
JUNIOR COLLEGE $36,750.00| $36,750.00]no bid $39,455.00| $39,455.00]no bid no bid $37,000.00| $37,000.00]no bid no bid
Model I-Sculpt CNC I-Script
er CNC 2105 3-D #CNC2105
Warranty| 2 Years non-wear Items 2 year non-wear parts
20 1 CNC BIT PACKAGE
$982.50 $982.50] no bid $1,092.00|  $1,092.00]no bid no bid $1,000.00|  $1,000.00]no bid no bid
21 1 [TRIM SAW MODEL 20
$5,550.00)  $5,550.00]no bid $5,933.00) $5,933.00]no bid no bid $5,700.00|  $5,700.00]no bid no bid
Model I-Sculpt CNC I-Sculpt 30 1-Sculpt CNC
er Model 20 $2,105.00 Model 20
Warranty| 2 Years non-wear Items 24 months 1 year non-wear parts
2 1 [3-DAY CAD TRAINING
$1,000.00] _$1,000.00]no bid $1,060.00| _$1,060.00]no bid no bid $1,500.00| _$1,500.00]no bid no bid
TOTAL $44,282.50 $820.04 $107,211.30 I $17,307.19 $55,279.68 $45,200.00 $46,544.74 $55,551.46
CERTIFICATION OF CONTRACT BIDDER Yes | Yes Yes | Yes Yes Yes | Yes Yes
ADDENDUM #1 Yes | NO Yes | Yes Yes Yes 1 Yes Yes




